
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Daphne Wallace 
Cc: ann rodriquez 

Subject: Re: Landscaping Order - December 2, 2015 
Date: Wed, 02 Dec 2015 17:43:49 +0000 

ok to pay 
anna going forward please wait until you have all info below before seeking jee approval as there is almost 2,200 
of costs he was not made aware of.. 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax
cell

> On Dec 2, 2015, at 12:40 PM, Daphne Wallace < Ella> wrote: 

> Greetings Rich, 

> For payment via AMEX: $9,459.05 

> SiteOne Landscape Supply (John Deere Landscapes) - Quote 66585945, requested by Chris 11/12, approved 
by JE 12/1 

> Estimated Tropical Shipping charges: $1,649.98 

> Estimated Custom duties, not to exceed: $567.54 
> The vendors are still researching the Country of Origin of the products - estimate based on all of the products 
being foreign made 

> Clearance fees: $65.00 

> Please advise, DW 

> <SiteOne Landscape Supply Order # 66585945.pdf> 
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