From: William Blum <{|| | | -
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com™>
Subject: RE: Fees
Date: Thu, 18 May 2017 22:54:08 +0000

Thanks, Jeff. I will wait to hear back from you.

BTW, when you meet with the Governor, please let him know that | am planning to testify on the bill at the Legislature
once the hearings are set.

Bill

William Blum | Partner
SOLOMON BLUM HEYMANN LLP
40 Wall Street, 35th floor

Mew York, NY 10005

Tel 212.267.7600

Fax 212.267.2030

Email

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, May 18, 2017 6:51 PM

To: William Blum

Subject: Re: Fees

understood , iam meeting with the governore this week, he thought it imporant that the govt pay, for pr
purposes at a minimum , not nice, ill report back aft3r the meeting

On Thu, May 18, 2017 at 6:46 PM, William Blum <] G- ot

Hi, Jeff. I hope all is well.

As you know we completed most of our work on the legislative project for you (now the “Financial Services
Improvement Act of 2017) over six months ago. However, the bulk of our fees for this project (billed through
Erika’s firm) have not yet been paid and we have been patiently waiting for that to happen.

Erika tells me that this may have to do with the fact that the Governor preferred to have the fees paid by his
office or by Peter Hiebert's firm. Exactly who cuts the check to us is not that important to us, but since you are
the client and you engaged us for this work, we have no choice but to look to you for payment.

Can you please arrange to make payment now? Erika can provide you with the exact amount if you need it. If
you want to discuss, of course | am available.

Yours,
Bill

William Blum | Partner
SOLOMON BLUM HEYMANN LLP
40 Wall Streat, 35th floor

Mew York, NY 10005

Tel 212 .267.7600

Fax  212.267.2030

Email
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JEE
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
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