
From: Heather Gray

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: Sublime - letter and invoice 

Date: Mon, 18 Sep 2017 22:14:46 +0000 
Attachments: Klee_letter_to_Sublime_v.3.pdf 

Okay, here is the revised letter. Okay to send to Anna? 

From: jeffrey E. [mailtoleevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Monday, September 18, 2017 6:11 PM 
To: Heather Gray < > 
Subject: Re: Sublime - letter and invoice 

yes it ok 

On Mon, Sep 18, 2017 at 6:10 PM, Heather Gray < > wrote: 

But do we 100% feel comfortable that Sublime will give us the money? I don't know Anna at all. She may be perfectly 
trustworthy, but ... 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, September 18, 2017 6:06 PM 
To: Heather Gray c > 
Subject: Re: Sublime - letter and invoice 

I would change it to say once sublime receives the money you will allow it to ship. otherwise we wil be 
dealing withescrows etc 

On Mon, Sep 18, 2017 at 5:58 PM, Heather Gray < > wrote: 

Hi Jeffrey, 

Please see the revised letter and the invoice and let me know if you have any comments. I won't send the 
revised letter to Anna until I hear from you. 

Best, 
Heather 

Heather Gray 
Art Counsel 
Elysium Management LLC 
445 Park Avenue Suite 1401 
New York NY 10022 
646-589-0315 
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