From: Richard Kahn <||| | RN
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: nick
Date: Tue, 12 Sep 2017 21:53:31 +0000

just called says he is sick and working in and out of meetings..
i said where are we with repayment?

he said 1 want to call you tomorrow morming as it 15 a long story..
1 said that 1 am concerned about repayment?

he said 1 am a man of honor and would never screw a friend then hung up on me..

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 212-320-0381

cell [ NN

Begin forwarded message:

From: Nicholas Ribis <

Subject: Re:
Date: September 12, 2017 at 3:58:50 PM EDT
To: Richard Kahn <| i -

Richard- in a meeting call u later- Nick

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 12, 2017, at 3:51 PM, Richard Kahn <] | N - ot

nick just called vour cell and left a voicemail
please call me when free with an update
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 212-320-03581

EFTA00664894



cell NN

On Sep 11, 2017, at 9:32 AM, Nicholas Ribis <] G - '
Richard - out west still working on it I will call u later to update u - Nick

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 11, 2017, at 9:06 AM, Richard Kahn *—'-* wrote:

i understand that your deal 1s done - congrats. ..
when can we expect repayment of the 200k?
please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

975 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 646-350-0954

cell NN

EFTA00664895



