
From: Larry Visoski

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: B727 engines 

Date: Thu, 25 Aug 2016 17:55:19 +0000 

No sir,.its always been $800k price and $750k to you. 
If that was the case I would've certainly brought that to your attention immediately. 

I will confirm, it was my understanding, that was Frank's invoice to us not from the buyers 

I will Confirm 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 25, 2016, at 1:52 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

I thought he last offer was 750 gross 700 to us 

On Thursday, 25 August 2016, Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Jeffrey 
Just to clarify, all along, the Miami buyer was offering $800k which was $750k net to you, $50k to Frank, 
Do you think offer was originally higher? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 25, 2016, at 1:21 PM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Frank , why did the price drop 

On Thursday, 25 August 2016, Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Frank's response 
How do we reply? 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "RIVERA, Frank" < 
Date: August 25, 2016 at 1:13:30 PM EDT 
To: Larry Visoski 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: B727 engines 
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Hi Larry, 

Understood. We must issue LOI and you accept with Deposit prior to Inspection. Its the way its done. 
This is reason we sent you draft LOI and ESPA. 

Best Regards, 

Frank Rivera 
Sent Via T-Mobile 4GLTE w/Samsung Note5 

On Aug 25, 2016 1:11 PM, "Larry Visoski" c wrote: 
Frank, 
let's just close after your inspection. Too much time wasted in writings 
thnks 

Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 

EFTA00665620



destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA00665621


