
From: Richard Kahn • 

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Re: arda 

Date: Fri, 06 Oct 2017 19:30:44 +0000 

jsc 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022
tel
fa 
cel 

On Oct 6, 2017, at 3:29 PM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

who pays her salary 

On Fri, Oct 6, 2017 at 3:17 PM, Richard Kahn

please advise on entity to pay from 
JEE / HBRK / DKI / Something else.. 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 

cel 

wrote: 

On Oct 6, 2017, at 11:52 AM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Ok 
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 Forwarded messa e 
From: arda beskardes 
Date: Fri, Oct 6, 2017 at 11:12 AM 
Subject: Re: should i 
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

karyna. thanks.. 

M. Arda Beskardes 
Attorney-at-Law 

By Appointment Only 

I -t 
-e 

www.hukuk.pro

222 

Admitted to practice law in New York and Tennessee 

Warning: Unless you have a signed engagement letter with me, you should not consider information contained herein as legal 
advice and you should check with your own counsel before relying on this message. 

On Thu, Oct 5, 2017 at 5:59 PM, Arda Beskardes c wrote: 
ok 

sent via mobile with thumbs not designed for touchscreens, please excuse the typos! 

M. Arda Beskardes 
Attorney-at-Law 

By Appointment Only 

  -t 
-e 

www.hukuk.pro

Admitted to practice law in New York and Tennessee 

Warning: Unless you have a signed engagement letter with me, you should not consider 
information contained herein as legal advice and you should check with your own counsel before 
relying on this message. 

On Oct 5, 2017, at 17:49, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.corn> wrote: 

Send MI 

On Thu, Oct 5, 2017 at 4:24 PM arda beskardes < > wrote: 
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I I I send the invoices for karyna and to you? 

M. Arda Beskardes 
Attorney-at-Law 

By Appointment Only 

-t 
iMe 
www.hukuk.pro

Admitted to practice law in New York and Tennessee 

Warning: Unless you have a signed engagement letter with me, you should not consider information contained herein as 
legal advice and you should check with your own counsel before relying on this message. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
<karyna invoice.pdf> 

please note 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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