From: Richard Kahn _
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
Subject: NES a'v proposals
Date: Wed, 10 Jun 2015 18:07:29 +0000
Attachments: Quickestimate298Epstein.pdf

attached are two proposals along with link below for the recommended remote RTI T3x

http://www.rticorp.com/products/wireless-interfaces/t3x-universal-controller. html

http:wwwovolutone.com/RTI-T3X-HANDHELD-SYSTEM-CONTROLLER-35-COLOR-TOUCH-
P16819.aspx

as per our conversation remote will be programmed to control everything with exception of shades and lighting
1 also need to have vendor clarify if their 1,800 fixed price includes installation of epson projector as it 1s not
mentioned on quotes

Proposal 1 - Control theater with RTI T3x

Materials 2.067.00
Labor 1,800.00
Sales Tax 343.20

Total Cost with tax 4.210.20

Proposal 2 - Control theater with iPad Air 2

Materials 2. 187.00
Labor 1.800.00
Sales Tax 353.85

Total Cost with tax 4.340.85

Please advise 1if pricing ok and your preference of Proposal | or Proposal 2

Thank vou

Richard Kahn
HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
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Begin forwarded message:

EFTA00667068



Date: June 9, 2015 at 12:57:50 PM EDT
From: Merwin Dela cruz
Reply-To: Merwin Dela cruz
To: Richard Kahn
Cc: Larry Visoski
Subject: Fw: alv proposals

Hi Rich,
Please see attached proposals.

Thank you

Merwin Dela Cruz

|
Cell.

On Tuesday, June 9, 2015 11:37 AM, Zinon Zinon || GGG ot

Merwin,

Attached are Estimate #298 (controlling theater with hand held remote) and Estimate #299

{controlling theater with I-pad) for your review.
Thank you.
Zinon Zinon

Savalex Audio Video

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:

This message is intended for the addressee only and may contain confidential or proprietary
information. Any use or copying of this message or the information it contains other than by an
intended recipient and for the purposes for which it was sent is prohibited. Savalex Audio Video Corp.

reserves the right to monitor and archive all e-mail communications as legally allowed.
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