From: Mohamed Waheed <} R -
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Happy New Year
Date: Thu, 08 Jan 2015 03:25:31 +0000

Dear Jeffrey

Having talked to publishers and writers in Singapore, [ am told that it will cost me about 200,000 dollars to have
my book written and published. Finding a good writer is not easy. If you know one that would be great help.
Rory Gill, the communication guy who you provided earlier would be great if he has the time. He already
understands the context.

[ believe that the book will be useful to newly democratizing countries, university students studying crisis in
political transition, students of Maldivian history, and Middle Eastern and Asian Studies.

Appreciate your help.
Best regards
Waheed.

Sent from my iPad

On Jan 3, 2015, at 1:40 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationf@ gmail com> wrote:

ves, what do you need /?

On Fri, Jan 2, 2015 at 10:51 PM, Mohamed Waheed <} R - ¢

Dear Jeffrey,

Hope you are well. Wishing you a healthy, happy and peaceful 2015, Heard sad news of Sultan. Hope he
recovers fast.

Jeffrey, | am trying to get a writer to assist me with a book on my five years in the presidency in Maldives. |
have found a young American lady with communication background who can do it. Can you help raise some
funds for this or find a publisher. You must know people.

Thanks for your help in the past.

All the best and warm regards

Waheed

President Waheed
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