From: [ <1 -
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com™>
Subject: Re:
Date: Thu, 02 Mar 2017 10:29:51 +0000

Thank you x

2 mapra 2017 r, B 11:20, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail com™ nanucan(a):

Let's wait see how you feel and yes even January ok

On Thu, Mar 2, 2017 at 10:34 AM | <5EGEEEEE - ot

Jeffrey,

The course takes 9 month and costs 28 850 € for cooking and 49 200 € cooking and patisserie. The next
enrolment 1s in June. I'm due the end of August and the first two month I won't be able to attend the class.
It 1s a lot of money for the course and [ really would like to have an opportunity to finish it. So if your offer
still will be valid, I would love to sign myself up for the course starting November.

V.

On 2 mapra 2017 r, at 9:03, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@/gmail.com™> wrote:

I guess you changd your mind.  good luck
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