From: Richard Kahn _}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Sportis Update
Date: Tue, 08 Jul 2014 17:54:46 +0000

Daphne and [ will continue to contact them daily as they seem to be moving to slow..

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Adam Zygowski " </

Subject: Re: update
Date: July 8, 2014 at 9:46:01 AM EDT

To: "Richard Kahn" >
Cc: "Daphne Wallace" < >, "ann rodriquez" <[ -
Hi,

Today we have been informed that we can collect the boat.

We need to arrange transportation - we tried to tow with Toyota Landerumser, however the trailer 1s too heavy.
Additionally the trailer has a different electrical socket than the one we use in Europe.

I hope tomorrow we manage to collect the boat.

What kind of car do you tow the trailer in USVI?

Best regards
Adam Zygowski

Dnia 07-07-2014 0 22:28:11 Richard Kahn _} napisal(a):

hope you are well and enjoyed vour time off

can you please confirm you have received boat and next steps

as 1 am sure vou can understand mr epstein is very anxious for some feedback
thank you

EFTA00669714



Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

SPORTIS S.A.

34-207 Koleczkowo

ul. Na Dambnik 22, Bojano Poland
tel. +48 58 676 01 22, 676 00 91
mob. + 48 697 250 500

fax: +48 58 676 00 92

www.sportis.com.pl

http://'www.facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385
http://twitter.com/#!/sportis_sa
https://plus.google.com/109174365046263030394

Rejestracja: Sad Rejonowy Gdansk Polnoc Oddzial w Gdansku,
VI Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475,

kapital zaktadowy: 2.058.170 PLN w calosci oplacony.

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdansk-Polnoe in Gdansk.

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279
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