
From: bellaklein 

To: Gul'sum Osmanova 

Cc: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Sat, 01 Mar 2014 12:42:37 +0000 

Hi Gulsum, 
I will contact Richard Clark on Monday with payment information and email you payment confirmation 

Thank you, 

Bella 

On Mar 1, 2014, at 1:11 AM, "Gul'sum Osmanova" < > wrote: 

Hi Bella, I've sent the form to Richard Clark the day before yesterday. Sony that I was not able to respond to 
your messages at that time, it's all because of time difference. 
Should I do something for payment proceedure? 

avec soin, 
Gul'sum Osmanova. 

EFTA00669813


