From: brice gordon —
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Ce: Rich Kabo |
Subject: Re: Pergolas
Date: Fri, 22 Feb 2013 22:41:59 +0000

Jeffrey

Confirming that 1 and 3 cistern have only a couple of very small repairs
Cistern 2 is the main concern
how do you wish to proceed

On Tue, Feb 19, 2013 at 2:07 PM, brice gordon KNGGGGGEEE -

As requested cost breakdown for 4 x pergolas to match existing in berm, except they are covered with white
lattice
wood materialPainted white, David plus helper 10 days

Cisterns
I need to clean out number one cistern tomorrow $o as to see expansion joint clearly
from initial inspection there some minor repairs to both 1 and 3.

On Tue, Feb 19, 2013 at 2:30 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail.com™ wrote:
1 would like a breakdown of cost s for this project and the cisterns labor and mateniall , thanks

On Tue, Feb 19, 2013 at 11:18 AM, brice gordon _Wule:

Jeffrey

the estimated cost for material, not including paint for the 4 x Pergolas is approx $5900.00
David estimates that it will take approx 2 weeks for him plus a helper to perform work.

Pokey will fimish off bathroom with David and complete Relax bath crown moulding this week and then
thats it for him.

Will find someone else who's a little fast
can we proceed with material purchase

Brice Gordon

UsVI1
Phone

New Mexico
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The information contained in this communication 1s
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
commumnicatnon or any part theraol 15 strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If vou have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationi@gmail.com, and

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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