From: Richard Kahn _}
To: "efirey E." < -
Subject: Fwd: Brick pavers
Date: Wed, 29 Jul 2015 19:59:03 +0000

total job cost per original bid was 10,500
do not think it is fair for JJ to come back to us for 2,800 in additional labor
please confirm ok to be firm with JJ

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 646-350-0954

cell 917-414-7584

Begin forwarded message:

From: JJ Blea <N

Subject: Brick pavers

Date: July 28, 2015 at 11:36:23 PM EDT
To: Brice >

Cc: Richard Kahn <

Brice,

I am sending this email in regards to the brick paver job. The project was substantially larger than anticipated.
The elevation to create the finished product required more labor and material than either of us anticipated. The
placement of the the rocks, beams, lag bolts and additional dirt resulted in additional labor incurred by Three
B’s. 1 would ask that we be compensated for the additional labor we provided and 1s as follows; Roman 20.00

and hour, Antonio 12.00 an hour, Rphael 12.00 and hour and Jesus 14.00 an hour plus 22% WC. The additional
labor of 40 hrs at 70.00 and hour (4 men) and no markup comes to approximately $2800.00. Please let me

know how you would like me to proceed.
Respectfully,

1] Blea,

Three B’s LLC

EFTA00671388



