From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: Nick Ribis <[
Subject:
Date: Wed, 13 Sep 2017 12:55:06 +0000

please advise when you will call this am
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On Sep 12, 2017, at 3:58 PM, Nicholas Ribis <|| | | A - o <:
Richard- in a meeting call u later- Nick

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 12, 2017, at 3:51 PM, Richard Kahn ~"~'_'-'-* wrote:

nick just called vour cell and left a voicemail
please call me when free with an update
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On Sep 11, 2017, at 9:32 AM, Nicholas Ribis <|| GG - o'

EFTAO0673377



Richard - out west still working on it [ will call u later to update u - Nick

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 11, 2017, at 9:06 AM, Richard Kahn *_'-* wrote:

i understand that your deal is done - congrats. ..
when can we expect repayment of the 200k?
please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

EFTAO00673378



