
From: emad hanna 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 

Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: 

Date: Fri, 29 Apr 2011 20:13:53 +0000 

Rich received the check from FTC with the invoices and he knew nothing about it and he came to me and asked 
me about it and I didn't know anything about it either. 
So I called Arran and asked him who approved it since there was no signature on the invoice and he told me he 
thinks Brice and Gary gave a verbal on it he wasn't sure. I emailed brice about it about an hour ago and he has 
not responded. We are holding the check here and not signing it 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 
301 East 66th St 
Suite I0F 
Nie:210 m
Cel 
LSJ Office 
St. Thomas Ice 
NY 

On Apr 29, 2011, at 4:04 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

could you tell about the lowell.. brice said he ordered 18k of parts???? how does this happen.? do not talk to 
brice on this 
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