
From: 
To: "Jeffrey / e / Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Fw: Email for Jeffery 
Date: Wed, 11 Dec 2013 18:03:01 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

They do the pricing. They do all the work to get the best price - coordinate the receiving and staging of delivery. 
This is a coordination of about 100 items. Some large. You need someone to warehouse the delivery. 
Tara will send you/sue . -- you have changed maybe 30+ items. 
I'm having her send specification sheets of/for the new items. 
Sent via BlackBeny by AT&T 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: Wed, 11 Dec 2013 11:54:23 -0400 
To: Stephen Hanson<1 
Subject: Re: Fw: Email for Jeffery 

i want a list of fumitrue prices that has been decided,  i do not need a purchasing agent agrewement until i 
see that, this is stupid 

On Tue, Dec 10, 2013 at 11:12 PM, > wrote: 
Sent via BlackBeny by AT&T 

From:M 
Date: ue, Decec 2013 16:33:42 -0500 
To: 
Subject: Email for Jeffery 

Steve, 
As discussed I am at a complete stand still as all work is complete and specified. Meetings with both the GC 
and the purchasing agent (PMG) took place and they are ready to begin work, but they need their signed 
contracts. I need approvals on both the CG contract as well as the purchasing agents contract inorder to 
move forward. These were both sent to Richard Kahn on Nov. 5th. I sent Richard and email requesting a call 
to follow up on any questions and this call did not happen until 11.19. I explained to Richard quite clearly that 
in order to get the revised purchase order (first pass was sent, but this did not include the changes from JE) for 
the furniture and for us to move forward the proposal from PMG (total of $8,500) that I sent over needs to be 
signed and the deposit check will need to be sent. I have sent an email every 3 days to Richard requesting a 
follow up with no response. If we are to meet our timeline I need to have all signed off on so that we can 
move forward in a timely manner. I have spoken to Michael Borrico and he is ok with the schedule starting 
phase one of construction mid January, but the PMG contract needs to be signed. I really don't know what the 
hold up is on a $8,500 contract. This is peanuts and it has been in their hands since the beginning of 
November. Please have JE contact me directly so that I can explain this all to him. I hate that you have to deal 
with this along with all the other shit going on. Keep me posted. 

Thanks, 

EFTA00678271
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