From: Bella Klein <|| | -
To: Jeffrey Epstein - I
Subject: Re: Amex Hermes

Date: Thu, 27 Apr 2017 15:00:32 +0000

Jeffrey,
Hermes confirmed store credit of 9,135 Euros and as per my request will wire refund to your account. Wire
process takes up to 4 weeks. Email from Hermes 1s below.

Dear Madam,

Mr Jeffrey Epstein has a credit note with us of 9.135€

Should he wish a refund, could he please send us his bank details please 7
This will take approximately 4 weeks from the time we have the information.
| stay at your disposal.

Kind regards

Maria Matias

HERMES

17, rue de Sévres 75006 Paris
01.42.22.80.83

Thank vou,
Bella

Tel: 212-971-1307

On Apr 25, 2017, at 3:51 PM, jeffrey E. *i—“-* wrote:

coordinate wirh - she has all the details

On Tue, Apr 25, 2017 at 3:31 PM, Bella Klein <]l NN - 1 otc:

Will call Hermes store in the morning as credit was not received.

Thank you,
Bella
Tel: 212-971-1307

On Apr 25, 2017, at 1:13 PM, jeffrev E. *’_‘-* wrote:

the 9744 was canceled 1t was a chair that was going to be sent

On Tue, Apr 25, 2017 at 1:12 PM, Bella Klein ﬂ_ wrote:
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Jeffrey,

Please confirm 2 charges from Hermes during your Paris visit.

04/05/2017 HERMES SELLIER - PARIS, PA
04/01/2017 HERMES SELLIER - PARIS, PA
Thank you,

Bella

Tel: 212-971-1307

please note
The information contained in this communication 1%
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to ﬁ: and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential. may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to h: and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

0,744.31
2,482.40

EFTA00679000



