From: Richard Kahn < -

To: leffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=
Subject: FW:
Date: Fri, 05 Feb 2016 00:42:58 +0000
Attachments: Vacation_Rem_Revl.pdf

Brice new proposal has cost of 1900 (vs 7900) with the following dates off:

March 10-14
April 6-17

Please advise if dates are ok
Thank you

Rich

From: Brice Gordon <zdc.ridl @gmail.com=
Date: Thursday, February 4, 2016 at 4:50 PM
To: Richard Kahn <[ -
Cc: Zorro Ranch <zorro.office @gmail.com>
Subject: Re:

Rich

To try and salvage something out of our vacation expenditure
waould Jeffrey be open to the following

The original dates 17th Feb to 28th Feb, requested November 2015, Request forwarded to Lesley 3 Dec, 2015

Mew Dates

10th March to 14th March, please note leffrey is in AZ at that time.

&th April to 17 April, Belize Mexico, these dates have already been approved
This will utilize all airfare purchased and hotel with minimal change orders
Original Estimated cost to cancel trip 57900.00

Estimated cost with changes: 51700.00

We now have to overnight in Atlanta on our way to Belize, hence hotel charge.
We would like to proceed with changes asap

will this work?

On Wed, Feb 3, 2016 at 3:26 PM, Zorro Ranch <zde.rtdl@grmail.com:> wrote:

Ok
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Will work with Lesley next time and make sure you are aware of our plans
We always consider vacation time a privilege not a right
Regards Brice

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 3, 2016, at 1:09 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com:> wrote:

sorry to screw up your vacaiton, iddint know tell me details ialways want you to have your time at your time

please note
The infarmation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-rmail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

Brice Gordon
Stanley, NM

ph
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