
From: Richard Kahn 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: 
Date: Sat, 28 Mar 2015 18:53:00 +0000 

please advise if ok to send 21,600 to. and DB account for rent and telephone for 2015 

rent 1500 x 12 = 18,000 
at&t telephone 300 x 12 3,600 

total 21,600 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: bellaklein  
Subject: Rent 2015 
Date: March 27, 2015 at 4:41:53 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < 

is here and asking for 8H rent and telephone expenses for 2015 January - December. Rent is approximately 
$1500 and telephone $300. Total $1800 per month and $21,600 for 2015. The last time she was reimbursed was 
over a year ago. I am looking for the backup..but don't see it. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

EFTA00680143


