
From: 

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 

Date: Fri, 31 Mar 2017 17:58:03 +0000 

Yes thank you. The rent I am paying is 1.700 euros, on those 10k I've paid the rent, food, gym, transport... I 
cannot afford it anymore and the owner wants the house back to rent it long term. In France it is super 
complicated to find a house with no guarantee and no salary and the house I was renting since now was from a 
friend. I don't now where to go and I have all my luggages and stuff that I have to move out 

I giomo Fri, Mar 31, 2017 alle 7:40 PM Jeffrey E. leevacation®gmail.com> ha scritto: 
did you receive the 10k i sent/7 

On Fri, Mar 31, 2017 at 7:38 PM, wrote: 
Today I've seen the photographer and he told me he would let me know on Monday if he would take me or 
not. He was very nice and I think I could learn a lot from him. It would be an internship and I don't think it's 
paid. I also met a very good friend of Tim Walker last night who told me that he can organize an interview 
with him in London if I wanted. I have to leave my apartment in a week because the contract is over and I 
cannot pay anymore and I have nowhere else where to go, basically in a week I'm in the road. 
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