
From: Nick Lambros 

To: jeffrey epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: 

Date: Fri, 15 Apr 2011 11:41:17 +0000 

No Sir it is not quite finished yet. I ordered the filler plates and they are on there way. We removed more 
equipment that left extra openings. The parts were ordered yesterday . I made both Scott and Rich aware of it. I 
was going to do another calibration on the Sony today. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 15, 2011, at 7:26 AM, jeffrey epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

> <photo.JPG> 

> Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 
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