
From: Richard Kahn

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jecvacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: update 

Date: Fri, 14 Dec 2012 19:29:07 +0000 

Please confirm that $4,000 is approved for for period Nov 15 - Dec 15 from Enhanced 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: December 14, 2012 2:20:53 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: update 
Reply-To: 

Hi Rich, 

I had a good meeting with Jeffrey today. He is okay with my being paid for December 15th. And will decide on a 2nd 
month with Reputation after he has a conference with them on Monday. I am waiting to finalize the time on Monday. 

Thank you for wiring $4,000 to my bank of America account for Dec 15th. I will be in touch on Monday after the 
conference. 

Hope  are well. 

cell: 
email: 

EFTA00683584


