From: Richard Joslin <] -

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com™>

CC: lawrence delson <G -

Subject: Re: avionetta invoice

Date: Thu, 22 May 2014 13:57:17 +0000

The april YTD 15 a formula error. It sums 2014 YTD and full year 2013.

On May 22, 2014, at 9:26 AM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

please look at avionetta april 2014 that vou sent me, vtd cost??77?
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