
From: Zorro Ranch < 

To: Rich Kahn < 

Cc: jeffrey epstein leevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Wire-Transfer Information-4-1-11 

Date: Mon, 11 Apr 2011 10:52:26 +0000 

Good Morning Rich, 
Based on JE's last E Mail could you please transfer $12,400, (rounding oft) $15,000 minus $2,576.18 for corral 
panels 
The cattle sale is today, Steve has already left for Roswell 
Could you please confirm when the funds are in his account 
Thanks 
Wannest regards 

 Forwarded message 
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, Apr 8, 2011 at 6:20 PM 
Subject: Re: Wire-Transfer Information-4-1-11 
To: Zorro Development

yes he has 15 to spend including corral 

On Fri, Apr 8, 2011 at 11:47 PM, Zorro Development < wrote: 
FYI 
Zorro Development had the opportunity to purchase 20 head of cattle, black Angus steers - weaned with shots 
today at $14,700, if funds had been available 
Please advise if Steve should even go to the live sale in Roswell on Monday 

6100 Red Hook Quarters B3 
St Thomas 
USVI 00R02 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn
Date: April 8, 23 Heisei 11:47:46 AM AST 
To: Zorro Development
Subject: Re: Wire-Transfer Information-4-1-11 

update is that i am waiting on jee approval for 15k and increase from 800 per cattle pricing 
please forward if you have one 
On Apr 8, 2011, at 11:39 AM, Zorro Development wrote: 

EFTA00685421



Hi Rich 

Any updates 

Steve is at the Belen stock sale 

Thanks 

6100 Red Hook Quarters B3 

St Thomas 

USVI 00802 

Ph: 

On Apr 7, 23 Heisei, at 3:01 PM, Richard Kahn < 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 

wrote: 

EFTA00685422



including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

Z017'0 Development Corp 
49 Z017'0 Ranch Road 
Stanley, NM 87056 

Ranh Mana er 

EFTA00685423


