From: Richard Kahn _}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
Subject: Joscha
Date: Mon, 15 Jun 2015 20:17:24 +0000

my records show all funding from Enhanced as follows:

4-3-2014 35,000
5-29-2014 15,000
10-6-2014 25,000
10-31-2014 50,000

total funding 125,000

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel
fa
cel

On Jun 15, 2015, at 1:02 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com> wrote:

we need to deal with josha extra funding needs
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