From: Eric Roth *i_a

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com>

CC': Larry Visoski - Jay Massar _

Subject: Re:
Date: Sun, 24 Sep 2017 14:27:00 +0000

Understood.

Rh galley additional lighting will cost approx $3.000 plus engineering and install. Do you really want this or just

recover in the white ultraleather?
Best regards,
Eric

Eric H. Roth, President
International Jet Interiors

www.intljet.com

On Sep 24, 2017, at 10:22 AM, jeflrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com> wrote:

there will be many high level leaders on the 550; . many. good for you if you can do the divan arms. ifnot, I

understand, 1 would like to take the plane next saturday. or sunday. .

please note
The information contained 1n this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

wow what a mess on the 1slands.
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