
From: 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Re: agree 
Date: Wed, 20 Sep 2017 17:08:57 +0000 

Thank you!! 
How are you? All good? 

On Wed, Sep 20, 2017 at 1:07 PM Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

On Wed, Sep 20, 2017 at 12:59 PM 
She wrote 2100$ extra 

On Wed, Sep 20, 2017 at 12:57 PM jeffrey E. <jeevacation@grrtn> wrote: 
IM dollars 
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