From: Richard Kahn <}

To: leffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=
Subject: zorro furniture
Date: Tue, 28 Apr 2015 23:23:39 +0000
Attachments: ZDC_RESTORATION_HARDWARE_042815.pdf

Please confirm attached is approved for Zorra
It appears that they are not putting thru 15C (which I think receives a 20% discount)
Thank you

From: Zorro Ranch <|j G -
Date: Tuesday, April 28, 2015 at 7:10 PM

To: Richard Kahn <[ -
Cc: bellaklein <[ G

Subject: Re: AMEX

Good evening Rich,

Attached furniture list, | will place order around 8 am tomorrow
Warmest regards

Karen

On Tue, Apr 28, 2015 at 3:23 PM, Richard Kahn <[} R - - <'=:

before you charge can you please send paperwork for review
thanks

>0n Apr 28, 2015, at 5:22 PM, Zorro <|| GGG ot::

o |
= Good afternoon
= FY1 | will be placing 10 to 12k depending on final options on JE's CC tonight

= For furniture that JE has approved, my understanding is this should be no issue on his AMEX, but wanted to give you the

heads up

= |f any issues please let me know
= Warmest regards

-

|

= Sent from my iPhone

EFTA00688318



Zorro Develapment Corp
49 Zorro Ranch Road
Stanley, NM 87056

Ranch Manager
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