
From: 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Dr Magnania30315 
Date: Wed, 04 Mar 2015 21:56:43 +0000 

Hi sneaky dog, 
yay, thank you so much' 111 11 t xoxoxoxoxoxoxoxoxooxoxoxoxoox 
How are you? being a good boy?;)))1o1 

On Wed, Mar 4, 2015 at 1:16 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

----- Forwarded message   
From: bellaklein  
Date: Wednesday, March 4, 2015 
Subject: Fwd: Dr Magnanin 030315 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Jeffrey, 
Attached please fin' Invisalign treatment invoice in the amount $7525. Please confirm payment. 
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