
From: Jeff <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To:' ' < 

Subject: Re: (no subject) 

Date: Fri, 13 Jul 2012 06:09:08 +0000 

Yes 

Sent from my iPad 

On Jul 12, 2012, at 11:02 PM, wrote: 

Jeffrey,. 
Last week I met with Rich Kahn, he indicated my kids outstanding loans where $131.000 and he was going to apply the 
$150,000 commission from S76 deal if your still in agreement, 
IF your willing? may I use that remaining balance toward my kids tuition. 

thank you, 
Lany 

EFTA00691359


