
From: Richard Kahn 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Goldsmiths' College Contribution 
Date: Wed, 01 Mar 2017 20:53:51 +0000 

Attachments: Goldsmiths'_College_Grant_Agreement.pdf 

darren has yet to receive back signed agreement along with wire instructions 
should darren pursue further or pass? 

did 15k to peter from gratitude replace this transaction? 

please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Darren Indyke < 
Subject: Re: Goldsmiths' College Contribution 
Date: January 23, 2017 at 11:43:55 AM EST 
To: Karen Samuel 
Cc: Peter Fenwick >, Joydeep Bhattacharya 

Please see attached a grant agreement signed by Enhanced Education. Please return a countersigned copy to 
me by email, along with wire transfer instructions, so that Enhanced Education may complete the £ 85,000 
grant. Thank you. 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

New York, New York 10022 
Telephone: 
Telecopier: 
Mobile: 
email: 

EFTA00691513



************* 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - 2017 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 

On Jan 20, 2017, at 5:33 AM, Karen Samuel < wrote: 

Dear Mr Indyke, 

Please find attached an amended draft contract for your review. 

We look forward to hearing from you in due course. 

Best regards 
Karen 

From: Darren Indyke mailto 
Sent: 19 January 2017 21:40 
To: Peter Fenwick 
Cc: Karen Samuel; Joydeep Bhattacharya 
Subject: Re: Goldsmiths' College Contribution 

Dear Peter: 

I am actually Vice President of Enhanced Education, and not President. I also see that the draft you sent 
indicates that it is to be placed on Goldsmiths' College letterhead. Please resend with the correction of my 
title both at the top of the letter and in the signature line and send it on letterhead and I will sign it and return 
it. Thanks. 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

New York, New York 10022 
Telephone: 
Telecopier: 
Mobile: 
email: 

EFTA00691514



The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - O 2017 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 

On Jan 19, 2017, at 8:07 AM, Peter Fenwick < wrote: 

Dear Darren, 
Attached the final contract for Goldsmiths, could you please look through it and if you agree it, sign it, send it back 
to Karen (who I copied in) who will sign it and send it back to you with the payment details. The cost is £85 000 (k) 
GBP or today $104,712.00. US dollars. 
With many thanks for your help, 

Dr Peter Fenwick 

From: Darren Indyke 
Sent: 14 January 2017 21:59 
To: 
Subject: Goldsmiths' College Contribution 

mailto: 

Good day, Mr. Fenwick. 

Mr. Epstein asked that I contact you to request that you finalize the agreement below between Goldsmiths' 
College and Enhanced Education. Enhanced Education's information is as follows: 
Enhanced Education 
A U.S. Virgin Islands non-profit corporation 
6100 Red Hook Quarter, B3 
St. Thomas, USVI 00802 
Darren K. Ind ke, Vice President 
email: 

Once the agreement is finalized, please sign and return to me for countersigning and forward wire transfer 
instructions to me for the 105 Pounds wire. Thank you. 

Best, 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 

New York, New York 10022 
Telephone: 
Telecopier: 
Mobile: 
email: 

EFTA00691515



<Final contract aprove by Golsmiths.docx> 

<Final contract aprove by Golsmiths 3.pdf> 

EFTA00691516


