From: Richard Kahn <|| R
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>
Subject: Re:
Date: Fri, 18 Aug 2017 01:58:50 +0000

Alan said their response about payables and accrued expenses was legitimate.

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor

]

On Aug 17, 2017, at 9:30 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@ gmail.com= wrote:

did you get an ansser from alan on the next k1 ?
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