
From: Richard Kahn

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: S'17 Fuel 

Date: Fri, 20 Feb 2015 21:40:52 +0000 

when larry called hancock to place order for 10,000 gallons at 3.28 total cost into the plane he came back and 
said his pricing went up by 0.10 and is now 3.38 

please advise if we shall still proceed with purchasing 10,000 gallons 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

To: 
Subject: Re: STT Fuel 
From: Lvjet 
Date: February 19, 2015 at 3:43:26 PM EST 

yes, agree and frustrating,. would be amazing if the price went down,. of course he says up, when we want to buy fuel,. 
he informed that it changes twice a month, I forgot if it was Tuesdays or Thursday's to be honest with you,. I may be 
confused with Tuesday Rack price with Billy, if its Tuesday in St Croix,. 
I guess Hancock price is still better than Billy's $3.18 rack price,. 

I should know this answer, but how much does it cost to ship from St Croix to STT and into plane,. 
so if we pay, $3.18 in st Croix Rack price,. what does into plane final number end up to be? is it .20cents additional for 
shipping? or more? (I know we have add .10cents for Handcock into plane cost as well,. 
I'll agree with any thing you decide? maybe try Hancock for one load, and monitor price?, you know better than I if fuel barrel 
will rise. 

thx 
larry 

--Original Message--
From: Richard Kahn
To: Larry Visoski 
Sent: Thu, Feb 19, 2015 3:35 pm 
Subject: Re: STT Fuel 

a bit frustrating and typical michael games.. 
he told me prices change every tuesday so seems strange that price went up today on a thursday 
thoughts? 

EFTA00693582



Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Feb 19, 2015, at 2:39 PM, Lvjet <la wrote: 

Rich,. 
Handcock just called me,. todays fuel price in SJU has went up .03 cents,. now its $3.28 per gallon , plus the .10 cents into 
plane,. brings our total into plane, $3.38. 
let me know if you want to proceed and I'll have Michael send Wire instructions? 

thx 
Larry 

EFTA00693583


