
From: Jeffery Edwards <jeevaeationggmail.com> 

To: Bob Anderson , Curtis Royston  

Subject: Re: LSJ next phase: Design Development & Consultant Coordination 

Date: Mon, 13 Apr 2009 17:31:55 +0000 

please 
Coordonate with curtis rather than doug „ thanks 

On 3/11/09 6:21 PM, "Bob Anderson" wrote: 

Jeffrey-
We are ready to proceed into the design development phase of the project, but need to 

take care of a couple of things first. 

1. Aside from the comments you emailed previously and discussed with me on the phone 
(regarding the pavilion bathrooms, pavilion side entrances, pavilion basement access & service, 
and concept palette #1) do you have any other questions/comments? 

2. Warwick (my project manager) has been working with Doug on the final proposal, as well as 
retainer invoices we need (for us and our consultants) to begin coordination. Structural, MEP, 
lighting, A/V, pool and landscape consultants are ready to start. 

Please let me know if you need any other information regarding the Design Development 
retainers. 

(note: helipad garage, dock house, and pathway between main house & office will be a separate 
Schematic Design set, which will ultimately be added to the DD set) 

We're looking forward to getting our consultants together and progressing the design! 
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Regards, 

Bob 

Bob Anderson 
Senior Associate 

Gensler 
2500 Broadway Suite 300 
Santa Monica California 90404 
USA 

From: Warwick Wicksman 
Sent: Thursday, March 05, 2009 4:40 PM 
To: 
Cc: Amber Ratliff; Bob Anderson 
Subject: RE: Little St James 

Attached are Invoices for our DD retainer, and the Consultants SD retainer. 
Thanks, 
Warwick 

Warwick Wicksman, AIA 
Principal 

Gensler 
2500 Broadway 
Suite 300 
Santa Monica, California 90404 
USA 

From: Warwick Wicksman 
Sent: Thursday, March 05, 2009 3:47 PM 
To: 
Cc: Bob Anderson; 'Darren Indyke' 
Subject: Little St James 

Doug, 

Good speaking with you earlier! We are so glad you and Mr. Epstein are happy with the design and the 
progress of the work at Little St James! I forwarded the proposal and a cover note to Bob, and he is 
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going to send that on to Mr. Epstein. 

As we discussed, we really need to keep the team moving forward. I would like to kick off the DD phase 
for us next week, and get the consultants moving forward with their work. We need to get MEP and 
Structure, along the others. At this point, we have used up our entire SD fee, so to get the next phase 
moving, we need the next retainers. 

For Architecture, the next retainer is $50,000 (DD retainer). For the consultants, the retainer is $33,875 
(50% of their SD fee). These are each outlined in the proposal (attached for reference). 

Please let me know when I can expect a transfer. Also, as a reminder, please advise on the status of the 
reimbursables invoice from December (also attached). 

Thanks! 
Warwick 

Warwick Wicksman, AIA 
Princi al 

Gensler 
2500 Broadway 
Suite 300 
Santa Monica, California 90404 
USA 
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