
From: "Jennie Saunders"

To: <Jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Fw: Dangene McKay Bailey (NY) LLC 20ny0994730.2 

Date: Thu, 24 Feb 2011 16:18:32 +0000 

Should we do it ? 

CORE: Jennie Saunders I Founder & Chairman I 66 East 55th Street New York NY 10022 I Main: 
www.coreaccess.net 

From: Akinsemoyin, Mutiu A [mailto: 
Sent: Thursday, February 24, 2011 10:39 AM 
To: Jennie Saunders 
Subject: RE: Dangene McKay Bailey (NY) LLC 20ny0994730.2 

Hi Jennie, 

Mobile: 

As discussed, you have been approved for a $90,038.00 loan @ a fixed rate of 7.25% with monthly payments of $1392.05 
(principal and interest). The Small Business Administration (SBA) Packaging Fee of $250 and the SBA Loan fee of $912.00 will 
also be financed with the loan. This loan will be used to pay down your 100k line of credit, which has a current balance of 
90k. Doing this will free up your 100k line of credit for other business use. 
This will make your total bank loans and line = $190k 

Your advisor should feel free to reach out to me if he has any questions. 
I am a bit under the weather so I might work a half day today so in that case, I can be reached on my cell at 3475246086. 

Thank you. 

Mutiu Akinsemoyin 
Vice President 
JPMorgan Chase Business Banking 
51 West 51st Street 
New York, 
Telephone 
EFax -
Business Premier Line 
This transmission may contain information that is privileged, confidential, legally privileged, and/or exempt 
from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any 
disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of the information contained herein (including any reliance thereon) is 
STRICTLY PROHIBITED. Although this transmission and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus 
or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility 
of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by JPMorgan Chase & Co., its 
subsidiaries and affiliates, as applicable, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. If you received 
this transmission in error, please immediately contact the sender and destroy the material in its entirety, whether 
in electronic or hard copy format. Thank you. 
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