From: Anastasiva Siro q~_‘-*
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
Subject: Re:
Date: Fri, 10 Feb 2017 14:40:21 +0000

Yes, | believe so, he has my calendar and receipts to back it up.
Also will do group email now, so you can ask him numbers and ete, ok?

Regards,
Anastasiya Siro

On Feb 10, 2017, at 8:57 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

ves, does he have back up for expenses.? for ex.

On Fri, Feb 10, 2017 at 8:53 AM, Anastasiya Siro &_“-* wrote:

Hello!

Sorry, what do you mean by "all does™™
Did you receive my emails with gifts info, tax returns, and email from Jon? All sent yesterday

Thank you,

Regards,
Anastasiya Siro

On Feb 10, 2017, at 8:09 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

all doc s ?

On Thu, Feb 9, 2017 at 3:10 PM, Anastasiva Siro q~—“-* wrote:

Hello,

Will do.

[ can also email it to you now with all docs that Jon 1s planning to present on Tuesday.

Jon is meeting with my CPA on Monday to go over docs before his meeting with the officer on Tuesday.
[ also can do group email with me, you and Jon - that way he can email all docs you would like to see
promptly.

Let me know your preference,

Thank you!

-A
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On Feb 9, 2017, at 3:03 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation{@ gmail.com> wrote:

can you give leon a copy of the tax returns that are the subject of tues meeting. .

asked you for?

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note
The mmformation contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(agmail.com, and

what has the cpa
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(a gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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