
From: 
To: "Jeffrey E." -4 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Thu, 18 May 2017 17:47:25 +0000 

attached 
E mail dated Feb 8th 
From: BG to Patrick Adams with attached photo of Data Plate LSJ RO High Pressure 
E mail date Feb 8th 
From Patrick Adams to Integrity Pump with attached photo of data plate 
Patrick will review his E mail traffic tonight and forward any relevant information pertaining to this. 

On Thu, May 18, 2017 at 9:44 AM, jeffrey E. < > wrote: 
taken by whom sent by whom . WHERE IS the error.. since obviously there is one. 

On Thu, May 18, 2017 at 11:29 AM, ZM < > wrote: 
It is my understanding that all relevant information, photos of existing pump and more importantly to pump 
tags , which show, serial number and make up of pump, 
where sent to Integrity Pump Service 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 18, 2017, at 7:35 AM, jeffrey E. < > wrote: 

details of the pump screw up? 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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Stanley, NM 

Ph: (505) 934 2809 
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