
From: Martin Weinberg
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Cc: Martin Weinberg

Subject: ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGE 
Date: Tue, 13 Sep 2011 16:01:40 +0000 

Like the payment of legal fees to BJ, the 2255 waivers in a criminal agreement, the whole Rothstein debacle 
makes your case singular in terms of future discussions 

Martin G. Weinberg, Esq. 

20 Park Plaza, Suite 1000 

Boston, MA 02116 
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- - On Tue, 9/13/11, Jeffrey Epstein efrevacation@gmakcom> wrote: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Subject: 
To: "Martin Weinberg" < >, "Roy Black" < 
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Cc: "Christopher E. Knight" <1 >, "Lilly Ann Sanchez" < 

Date: Tuesday, September 13, 2011, 11:18 AM 

1m told that rothstein has allowed the trustee to depose him.. the feds were there, nurik has extensive notes 
that he is willing to share.. it also turns out that though brad edwards joined the rra firm in 09„ the email 
traffic says that scott was pimping my cases as early as dec of 08. Rothstein said that both adler ( brought 
edwards into the firm and rosenfielt knew of the scheme ). 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA00697872


