From: Ann Rodrnigquez
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Pokey
Date: Wed, 13 Jul 2016 14:24:43 +0000

Ok

Ann R,

On Jul 13, 2016, at 10:23 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail. com> wrote:

defintley not |, maybe next year. he let us down too many times,.

On Wed, Jul 13, 2016 at 10:22 AM, Ann Rodriquez _ wrote:

Hey Bossman,

Pokey 1s asking if he can get paid like the contractors at $25hr. and if his helper Mr. Oscal can also be added

at $20hr.?

Please advise,

Ann R.
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