From: Ann Rodriquc- N

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Chris Boat
Date: Fri, 06 May 2016 22:02:31 +0000

[ just called Kebo.
He said that he told Carlos to buy a Key switch, Wire harness & solenoid and the engines would be good.

Unless he change the wire harness the new solenoid won't work.

Ann R,

On May 6, 2016, at 5:43 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationf@gmail com> wrote:

Silly answer . It is an engine therefore fixable

On Friday, 6 May 2016, Ann Rodriquez [ NG o'

Carlos 1s saying now that the Engine has electrical 1ssues and they've changed the Starter solenoid, Key

switches and done an oil change.

He's suggesting that we purchase a used 300 single Yamaha for Chris boat.

Ann R.

On May 6, 2016, at 5:26 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail com=> wrote:

Mot sure why Chris boat not fixed
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