From: David Mitchell <djmi@mitchellholdings.com>
To: jeffrey E. <[
Subject: Re:
Date: Tue, 07 Nov 2017 01:02:43 +0000

Today’s guy
Azim Jamal
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Mitchell Holdings LLC
201 Madison Avenue
Mew York NY 10065
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On Nov 6, 2017, at 7:50 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(c gmail . com= wrote:

tomorow you must make 1t clear that cascade will audit the payments. . do you have another idea for who can
hold the money. ?
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