
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Cc: Jeanne Brennan

Subject: Scott Graff 
Date: Wed, 07 Nov 2012 20:17:29 +0000 

I just received another monthly invoice for scott in the amount of 2,000 
ytd to we have paid scoff 16,600 (including 2000 oct invoice) 
should i wait until next year to address per Brice or deal with now? 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: brice gordon  
Date: October 1, 2012 11:18:13 AM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Jeanne 
Subject: Re: Scott Graff 

FYI 
you need two men to check system, one to manually control zones the other to fault find, both help out with 
repairs 
if we went to 2 x a month, the question is then who would be reponsible for checking system when Scott does 
not come on site 
It would probably come down to Danny or myself, lets review early next year, right now we have enough on 
our schedules 
regards B 

On Sat, Sep 29, 2012 at 9:35 AM, LSJ < wrote: 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn
Date: September 28, 2012 4:54:00 PM GMT-04:00 
To: 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com>

EFTA00700192



Subject: Fwd: Scott Graff 

I am surprised that you have not responded to this email 
Can you please call me to discuss 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn <I 
Date: Se tember 10, 2012 4:26:58 PM EDT 
To: 
Cc: Jeanne Brennan 
Bcc: Daphne Wallace 
Subject: Scott Graff 

I would like to either have him cut back to 2x per month with 2 men or weekly with I man 
Let's discuss 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Brice Cordon 
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