
From: Richard Joslin < 

To: Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Merger of Meadow Lane Properties 

Date: Wed, 08 Oct 2014 22:17:32 +0000 

No change to insurance on SH Meadow. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Eileen Alexanderson • 
Date: October 8, 2014 at 5:58:07 PM EDT 
To: Ada Clapp >, Richard Joslin c 

Cc: Heather Gray >. Richard D'Aoostino 
Delson ( 
Subject: RE: Merger of Meadow Lane Properties 

, "Lawrence 

I spoke to Jeffrey Haber yesterday-alerted him to closing this week and fact that demolition would begin sometime this 
week. he will not be changing the coverage. SH Meadow Lane continues to be the insured. He said as long as another 
house will be on the property within the year it is preferable to keep the current coverage in force through the 
demolition and construction b/c there have been instances after a hurricane when it was difficult to get insurance. He 
will reassess appropriate level of coverage once construction is complete. 

From: Ada Clapp 
Sent: Wednesday, October 08, 2014 5:30 PM 
To: Richard Joslin; Eileen Alexanderson 
Cc: Heather Gray; Richard D'Agostino; Lawrence Delson
Subject: Merger of Meadow Lane Properties 

The deed confirming the merger of the two Meadow Lane properties (formerly 715 and 727) has been recorded and the 
merger complete. The property is now entirely owned by SH Meadow Lane LLC. Alerting you as this is important with 
respect to property and liability insurance. Once I have closing documents I will post them to the O drive. 

Please let me know if you have any questions. 

Ada Clapp 
Elysium Management LLC 
445 Park Avenue 
Suite 1401 
New York, New York 10022 
Direct Dial: 
Fax: 
Email: 

This communication and any attachment is for the intended recipient(s) only and may contain information that is 
privileged, confidential and/or proprietary. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that further 
dissemination of this communication and its attachments is prohibited. Please delete all copies of this communication 
and its attachments and notify me immediately that you have received them in error. Thank you. 
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