
From: Richard Kahn 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: LSJ_ISLMAR_CK_111912_$21,109.00 

Date: Sat, 01 Dec 2012 18:44:30 +0000 

This was invoice we spoke about last week that had a not to exceed price but was billed in full with no explanation 
Do not trust this vendor as it came from Arran 
Now Brice wants to setup monthly fee with them — seems strange 
Brice mentioned Barge is running better than ever which should be the case as we just spent over 92k with all work done 
Please advise on payment of this invoice 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Sat, 1 Dec 2012 15:22:03 +0100 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: LSLISLMAR_CK_111912_$21,109.00 

-----  Forwarded message -----
From 'c => 
Date: Fri, Nov 30, 2012 at 11:00 PM 
Subject: BLISLMAR_CK_111912_$21,109.O0 
To: "Richard Kahn (Gmail Contact)" 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein cjeevacation@gmail.com>

ISJ, LLC 
Island Manager 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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