
From: BMG
To: J Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Revision 3 from HydroGeologic Services, Inc. 
Date: Tue, 14 Aug 2012 03:31:27 +0000 

Attachments: HGS_Contract_Revised3.pdf; Scan.pdf 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: brice gordon
Date: August 13, 2012 6:08:51 PM GMT-04:00 
To: Rich Kahn
Cc: Zorro Ranch <zorro.office@gmail.com>, Darren Indyke

Subject: Fwd: Revision 3 from HydroGeologic Services, Inc. 

>, Frank Bond 

to all 
the first bore did not give positive indication to good yeild 
Jeffrey has approved HGS to move forward with a exploratory hole closer to well B 
6" casing this time 
I have attached both 8" and 6" estimates. 
AGAIN Can you please forward me the last contract that was approved 
any questions please call. Please note driller is still on sight and is moving to new location today 
There is also a cost for abandoning existing hole, this i will forward once received, 16K estimated. 

 Forwarded message 
From: Esperanza Cordova 
Date: Mon, Aug 13, 2012 at 
Subject: Revision 3 from HydroGeologic Services, Inc. 
To: brice gordon

Cc: Bill Whaley 

Greetings, 

Attached please find a revised estimated for drilling services, please feel free to contact Bill Whaley with any 
questions or concerns. 

Thank you, 

EFTA00701470



Esperanza D. Meis 

Office Administrator 

HydroGeologic Services, Inc. 

P.O. Box 94716 

Albuquerque, NM 87199-4716 

NM License No. WD-1472 

Brice Gordon 
Little Saint James 
USVI  
Phone: 

EFTA00701471


