From: Bella Klein <] -
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Ce: [N - - 1 ic Kahn <[ -
Subject: Re:
Date: Fri, 09 Mar 2012 14:36:47 +0000

All of the materials were coded to the inter company account NES LLC with description 301apt/2G.
Still looking into Penn...

On Mar 8, 2012, at 7:26 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

how did bella code this?

On Thu, Mar 8, 2012 at $:04 PM, | NG - - o

[ paid for all the matenals..tiles, toilet, sink, med cabinet and faucet/shower fixtures.
Anthony bought the tub. I'm not sure about the money to Penn; [ wasn't dealing with him

On Mar 8, 2012, at 7:28 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com™ wrote:

the money for jenns bathroom renovation would show up where. who paid for it .. 7 and what about

money to penn
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