From: Larry Visoski -}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Re:
Date: Mon, 22 Feb 2016 11:29:46 +0000

(Quick glance, engines appear due overhaul in 997 hours

I don't think it's mid life, which was completed 1'd assume at 4000 hours

This 1s the major overhaul,

I could confirm with Dallas AirMotive, but $1.5 - $2m per eng, wouldn't be out of line.,
I'll confirm

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 22, 2016, at 12:20 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationfwgmail.com™> wrote:
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