
From: Richard D'Agostino 

To: Brad Wechsler 

Subject: RE: Re: 

Date: Tue, 19 May 2015 19:42:52 +0000 

mjeevacation@gmail.comm <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Payment was made 

From: Brad Wechsler [mails 
Sent: Tuesday, May 19, 201(54. 
To: 'jeevacation@gmail.com'; Richard D'Agostino 
Subject: Re: 

I believe last week. Rich pls confirm. 

From: Jeffrey E. lmailtoleevacationagmail.coml 
Sent: Tuesday, May 19, 2015 03:15 PM 
To: Brad Wechsler 
Subject: Re: 

did the ipi check go out? 

On Tue, May 19, 2015 at 3:12 PM, Brad Wechsler wrote: 

Pm walking over to leon all art partnership does tomorrow (with art contribution schedules prepared by 
heather; 50mm from leon/narrows and 50mm from apo1/2 as per our conversation). 
As you know alan and ada have signed off on all, including apo-B trust agreement where I am trustee and art 
use agreement. I would expect leon to ask me if you have signed off on the later 2 agreements....Ada doesn't 
know and Alan's in europe with his family. Are you ok with these two agreements? Thx, b 

www.imax.com 
IMAX® is a registered trademark of IMAX Corporation. 

IMPORTANT NOTICE ***** *************************** 
Information contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments is confidential information intended 
only for the use of the individual or entity named above. 
Any reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this correspondence is hereby notified that any 
dissemination, distribution, copying 
or communication of the contents of this correspondence is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail was not addressed 
to you , please immediately notify us 
by phone in Canada a (collect calls will be accepted) or by email at 
and delete and destroy this 
correspondence inadvertently sent to you. Thank you 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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IMAX?) is a registered trademark of IMAX Corporation. 

IMPORTANT NOTICE 
Information contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments is confidential information intended only for the use of the individual or entity named 
above. 
Any reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this correspondence is hereby notified that any dissemination. distribution. copying 
or communication of th ' correspondence is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail was not addressed to you . please immediately notify us 
by phone in Canada at collect calls will be accepted) or by email at and delete and destroy this 
correspondence inadvertently sent to you. Thank you 
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