
From: Richard Kahn • 

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Re: UPDATE I Giacometti I Desk + Jewelry 

Date: Tue, 25 Apr 2017 14:57:27 +0000 

sorry as her email is not clear but this paragraph relates to sales tax as that is what was discussed yesterday 

We confirmed that upon receiving payment for the Louis IX Bureau Plat being sold in The Exceptional 
Sale, we could direct the proceeds from this lot towards the purchase of a lot acquired in the 
Magnificent Jewelry sale, as long as we receive payment for the bureau plat in advance of the payment 
due date for the jewelry lot. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

On Apr 25, 2017, at 9:34 AM, Jeffrey E. <jeevaeation@gmail.com> wrote: 

where 

On Tue, Apr 25, 2017 at 9:29 AM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
mentioned sales tax in her email below 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

On Apr 25, 2017, at 9:21 AM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
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sales tax? 

On Mon, Apr 24, 2017 at 6:19 PM, Richard Kahn > wrote: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: " < 
Subject: UPDATE I Giacometti I Desk + Jewelry 
Date: April 24. 2017 at 6:18:16 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < 

Dear Rich. 

As discussed I can confirm we will present the Giacometti as the back cover lot for our June Evening 
Sale of Impressionist & Modem Art in London. You may send back any amendments to the contract to 
my attention and I will add in our promises in Part 4 Marketing Schedule — Back Cover Lot. 

You mentioned Jeffrey's interest in bidding in our Magnificent Jewelry Sale this Wednesday. Please let 
me know if I can assist in setting up an Absentee Bid or if he wishes to bid by telephone, I can arrange 
for him to be on with a trusted colleague as I am out of the office Wednesday morning but should be 
back in the afternoon. 

We confirmed that upon receiving payment for the Louis IX Bureau Plat being sold in The Exceptional 
Sale, we could direct the proceeds from this lot towards the purchase of a lot acquired in the 
Magnificent Jewelry sale, as long as we receive payment for the bureau plat in advance of the payment 
due date for the jewelry lot. 

As always, do not hesitate to ask me any questions. I look forward to hearing from you. 

With best wishes, 
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I fax I e-mail 
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Visit to explore special multi-media sale im -cnotions, browse our illustrated 
catalogues and leave absentee bids through LotFinder(R), online search engine, and register 
for Internet bidding with Live(TM). 

This message and any attachment are confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, please 
telephone or email the sender and delete the message and any attachment from your system. If you are 
not the intended recipient you must not copy this message or attachment or disclose the contents to any 
other person. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
WE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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