From: Richard Kahn <||| | R

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: Estimate 910 from Subbase Drydock - Barge
Date: Tue, 22 Aug 2017 21:28:40 +0000
Attachments: Est 910 from Subbase Drydock 113124.pdf; Wire Transfer Instructions.PDF

anna, daphne and 1 spoke with Gene and Gene Jr. and the best we were able to do was negotiate a 3,227 or 5.1%
discount for final price of 60,000

this includes muffler parts, installation and painting and lay days at subbase dry dock

work will take approximately 3 weeks

bosco leaves town tomorrow so carlos will bring barge 1n and pickup the sooner of when you leave residence or
8/28

daphne will reach out to boyson to secure availability of their barge for necessary runs in our barges absence

please advise if ok to proceed with muffler and paint job
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRE. Associates Ine.
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace <|| G-
Subject: Fwd: Estimate 910 from Subbase Drydock
Date: August 22, 2017 at 2:39:43 PM EDT

To: Rich Kahn </

—-——— Forwarded message ———————
From: <
Date: Aug 22, 2017 2:38 PM

Subject: Estimate 910 from Subbase Drydock
To: = =

Ce: < -

Dear Anna:
Please review the attached estimate. Feel free to contact us if you have any questions.

I am also attaching the wire transfer instructions. We do need a 75% deposit as we will be ordering the
mufflers.
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We look forward to working with you.
Sincerely,

Debra Lowry
Subbase Drydock
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